
EASIEST WAY TO PUT ON LADDER CHAINS – With Cams  

Pull off the highway to a safe place before installing or removing tyre chains 

 

 

 

 

 

Lay chains out flat, remove 
all tangles. When chains are 
placed on the tyre, the cross 
hook eyes must face up (see 
the insert). Damage to your 
tyres could result if these 
hooks face against the tyre. 
 
 
 
 
 

Lay chain over the tyre, cross 
chain hooks up and the Cam 
fasteners on the outside of 
the tyre. Tuck the spare 
length of chain under the 
tyre. 
 
 
 
 
 

Move car until the chain end 
is axle high (move a 1/3 of a 
turn). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Hook inside fastener first*. 
HINT:- Push across the top 
chains to the inside, hook on 
to tightest link then pull back 
till even. Remove slack and 
hook the outside fastener to 
the tightest link. Tighten Cam 
Fasteners. Drive forward 
about 10 metres, stop and 
check if tight enough. If 
necessary, open Cams and 
repeat this step hooking onto 
next closer chain link etc. 

 
NOTES: 
Re-tighten chains when slack occurs. Maintain a tight snug fit throughout use. Adjust periodically to keep cross chains 
“straight” across the tyre tread. 
 
*Brand new chains may need to be trimmed on the first fit-up. 


